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Carnaval Músical Festival Coming Soon! 

The Parks, Recreation and Community Services Department invites you to the inaugural 
Carnaval Músical festival taking place Friday, September 20 - Sunday, September 22 at 
Fairmount Park. 

Carnaval Músical will showcase a variety of music genres from different regions such as 
Cumbias, Tejano, Banda and Mariachi. The event will also offer a fun-filled day for the 
family with exciting activities like carnival rides and games, michelada contest, beer 
and wine garden and entertainers such as La Sonora Santanera de Carlos Colorado, 
Banda La Fantastica, Dreaming of You - Selena Tribute - and international act La 
Sonora Dinamita.  

This 3-day event is sure to entertain everyone in the family...don't miss out! Tickets are 
available through Eventbrite by clicking on this link: 
https://www.eventbrite.com/e/carnaval-musical-tickets-65262018454.  
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About Riverside 
As the City of Arts & Innovation, Riverside, California is rich in history and culture, and is 
setting the pace in innovative practices for government, business and education. With a 
population of just over 300,000, Riverside is the largest city in the Inland Southern California 
region, the 12th largest city in California, and the 6th largest in Southern California. 
Riverside is home to four internationally recognized universities and colleges that support 
a growing college student population of nearly 50,000. Businesses and residents in 
Riverside benefit from city-owned electrical and water systems, high-speed fiber optic 
telecommunications, an easily-accessed freeway system, BNSF and UP rail access, and 
a large corporate jet and general aviation airport.  
 
With standards of excellence in technology, workforce development, arts, innovation, 
education and social capital the City has been named America’s #2 Hot Spot for Tech 
(Forbes, 2013); #6 Happiest Place for Young Professionals (Forbes, 2013); #3 ‘Can Do’ 
Capital (Newsweek, 2011); and the 2012 Intelligent Community of the Year by the 
Intelligent Community Forum. 
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